
 

 
 
 
DATE: BID TITLE & REFERENCE: 
January 10, 2013      Breakfast & Lunch Entrees, RFP #131503 
 
DESCRIPTION OF PURCHASE: 

 
A four (4) month pricing agreement, with an additional four (4) month renewal option, to provide 
breakfast and lunch entrees as stocked and distributed by the Central Warehouse for school 
cafeterias throughout the District.  Ninety-nine (99) items were bid and seventy-four (74) items are 
awarded.  Items will be purchased as needed to meet cafeteria needs.  Bid award(s) to the lowest 
bidder(s) meeting specifications.  
 
Effective Dates:  February 1, 2013 through May 31, 2013 (initial period). 
 

  
REQUESTED BY: 

 
Food Services 

    
SUPPLIER NAME:       ITEMS AWARDED: ESTIMATED EXPENDITURE: 
  

American Foods Group, Oklahoma City, OK               2    $   88,300.00 
American Pride Seafood, New Bedford, MA               1           2,100.00 
Asian Food Solutions, Oviedo, FL     2         32,600.00 
Bake Crafters Food Co., Collegedale, TN     2         37,000.00 
Cargill Kitchen Solutions, Monticello, MN    2         18,600.00 
Chef’s Corner Foods, Hayward, CA     3         79,300.00 
ES Foods, Woodbury, NY       3               26,300.00 
Father’s Table, Sanford, FL                 1         12,900.00 
J&J Snack Foods, Co., Pennsauken, NJ     2         21,900.00 
Jennie-O Turkey Store, Willmar, MN     7         52,500.00 
JTM, Harrison, OH       3       147,600.00 
Kelley Foods, Elba, AL     15       164,200.00 
Ling’s, South El Monte, CA      1         14,800.00 
Pilgrim’s, Tucker, GA       2         15,100.00 
Pro View Foods, Gainesville, GA      8         71,100.00 
Super Bakery, Cleveland, OH      1         30,700.00 
Sysco Gulf Coast, Geneva, AL    12       181,700.00 
Tasty Brands, Hicksville, NY      2         35,500.00 
US Foods-Lakeland, Lakeland, FL     5         87,100.00 

    
AMOUNT OF PURCHASE: FUNDING SOURCE: 

 
$1,119,300.00 Est. / 4 Mo.  Food Services Fund (4110) 

  
METHOD OF PROCUREMENT: 

 
ECSD Bid      Responses Received: 24    Bids Rejected: 1 
   

DATE AND TIME POSTED: 
 
January 10, 2013, 10:00 am CST 

 
9500PUR101 (11/10) Retention - 5 Years 

 
THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY 

PURCHASING DEPARTMENT 
75 North Pace Blvd.  

Pensacola, FL  32505 
 

BID AWARD NOTICE 



DATE: December 18, 2012
BID NBR: 131503
BID TITLE: Breakfast & Lunch Entrees

Where two prices are shown, the bottom price is the bid case/pack size 
Top price is unit price needed to determine low cost because of vendor differences in case count

ITEM
Single Sticks ea whole gr, ind. 2ct

Quantity: 100 cs 400 cs 100 cs 300 cs
0505970 0517010 0505980

ITEM NUMBER 1 2 3 4
Asian Food Solutions
Oviedo, FL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Father's Table
Sanford, FL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
US Foods-Lakeland 0.2613
Lakeland, FL No Bid 12.28 m,u No Bid No Bid
American Foods Group
Oklahoma City, OK No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
American Pride Seafoods
New Bedford, MA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bake Crafters Food Co
Collegedale, TN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cargill Kitchen Solutions
Monticello, MN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cargill Meat Solutions
Wichita, KS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Chef's Corner Foods
Hayward, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Don Lee Farms
Inglewood, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Filled Bagel Industries
Avon, IN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
ES Foods
Woodbury, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hadley Farms, Inc.
Smithsburg, MD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
J&J Snack Foods Co.
Pennsauken, NJ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Jennie-O Turkey Store
Willmar, MN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
JTM
Harrison, OH No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Kelley Foods 0.3919 0.2866 0.4257
Elba, AL 31.35 13.47 No Bid 30.65
Lings
South El Monte, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pilgrim's
Tucker, GA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pro View Foods
Gainesville, GA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Ridgefield's Brand Co.
Montgomery Village, MD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Super Bakery
Cleveland, OH No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sysco Gulf Coast 0.2963 0.1411 0.4965
Geneva, AL 23.70 12.70 No Bid 35.75
Tasty Brands
Hicksville, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Not Awarded

THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

75 NORTH PACE BOULEVARD
PENSACOLA, FLORIDA 32505

BID TABULATION

Awarded Items are highlighted

Toaster Pastries, French Toast Toaster Pastries, Toaster Pastries,
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ITEM
Toast Ready to ea whole grain Rolls

Quantity: 500 cs 1,000 cs 1,000 cs 1,000 cs
0517200 0517210

ITEM NUMBER 5 6 7 8
Asian Food Solutions
Oviedo, FL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Father's Table
Sanford, FL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
US Foods-Lakeland
Lakeland, FL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
American Foods Group
Oklahoma City, OK No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
American Pride Seafoods
New Bedford, MA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bake Crafters Food Co
Collegedale, TN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cargill Kitchen Solutions
Monticello, MN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cargill Meat Solutions
Wichita, KS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Chef's Corner Foods
Hayward, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Don Lee Farms
Inglewood, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Filled Bagel Industries
Avon, IN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
ES Foods
Woodbury, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hadley Farms, Inc. 0.3240 a,u 0.3094 a,u
Smithsburg, MD No Bid No Bid 14.58 m,u 11.14 m,u
J&J Snack Foods Co.
Pennsauken, NJ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Jennie-O Turkey Store
Willmar, MN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
JTM
Harrison, OH No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Kelley Foods 0.4548 0.1898 0.4246 0.4246
Elba, AL 38.20 18.22 30.57 30.57
Lings
South El Monte, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pilgrim's
Tucker, GA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pro View Foods
Gainesville, GA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Ridgefield's Brand Co.
Montgomery Village, MD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Super Bakery
Cleveland, OH No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sysco Gulf Coast 0.2813 u 0.4681
Geneva, AL No Bid 27.00 No Bid 33.70
Tasty Brands
Hicksville, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Item 6, Sysco, Bid rejected as non-responsive as vendor did not provide required information.

Texas Cinn. Cereals, Pastry, Mini-Cinn.
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ITEM
Bar Bkft Bar Turkey ea Turkey lb

Quantity: 800 cs 100 cs 300 cs 300 cs
0506160 0516200 0516210

ITEM NUMBER 9 10 11 12
Asian Food Solutions
Oviedo, FL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Father's Table
Sanford, FL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
US Foods-Lakeland 0.1792
Lakeland, FL 38.70 a,u No Bid No Bid No Bid
American Foods Group
Oklahoma City, OK No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
American Pride Seafoods
New Bedford, MA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bake Crafters Food Co
Collegedale, TN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cargill Kitchen Solutions
Monticello, MN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cargill Meat Solutions 2.5037
Wichita, KS No Bid No Bid No Bid 75.11 a,u
Chef's Corner Foods
Hayward, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Don Lee Farms
Inglewood, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Filled Bagel Industries
Avon, IN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
ES Foods
Woodbury, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hadley Farms, Inc.
Smithsburg, MD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
J&J Snack Foods Co. 0.2083 0.3958
Pennsauken, NJ 20.00 a,u 19.00 No Bid No Bid
Jennie-O Turkey Store 0.1794 0.1794
Willmar, MN No Bid No Bid 28.70 28.70
JTM
Harrison, OH No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Kelley Foods
Elba, AL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Lings
South El Monte, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pilgrim's
Tucker, GA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pro View Foods
Gainesville, GA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Ridgefield's Brand Co.
Montgomery Village, MD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Super Bakery
Cleveland, OH No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sysco Gulf Coast 0.1997 0.1961
Geneva, AL No Bid No Bid 31.95 82.35
Tasty Brands
Hicksville, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Not Awarded

Whole Grain Whole Wheat Sausage Link, Sausage Patty,
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ITEM
Gordita Bread lb Grilled ea

Quantity: 500 cs 300 cs 400 cs 200 cs
0517330 0516311 0516480  NEW 0516090

ITEM NUMBER 13 14 15 16
Asian Food Solutions
Oviedo, FL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Father's Table 0.1800
Sanford, FL 25.92 No Bid No Bid No Bid
US Foods-Lakeland
Lakeland, FL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
American Foods Group
Oklahoma City, OK No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
American Pride Seafoods
New Bedford, MA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bake Crafters Food Co
Collegedale, TN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cargill Kitchen Solutions 0.1090
Monticello, MN No Bid No Bid No Bid 32.69
Cargill Meat Solutions 1.4926
Wichita, KS No Bid 28.36 No Bid No Bid
Chef's Corner Foods
Hayward, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Don Lee Farms
Inglewood, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Filled Bagel Industries
Avon, IN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
ES Foods 0.3789
Woodbury, NY No Bid No Bid 60.62 m,u No Bid
Hadley Farms, Inc.
Smithsburg, MD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
J&J Snack Foods Co.
Pennsauken, NJ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Jennie-O Turkey Store 2.2900
Willmar, MN No Bid 48.32 No Bid No Bid
JTM
Harrison, OH No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Kelley Foods
Elba, AL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Lings
South El Monte, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pilgrim's
Tucker, GA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pro View Foods
Gainesville, GA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Ridgefield's Brand Co.
Montgomery Village, MD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Super Bakery
Cleveland, OH No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sysco Gulf Coast 2.3700
Geneva, AL No Bid 47.40 No Bid No Bid
Tasty Brands
Hicksville, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Not Awarded Not Awarded

Item #14 Not Awarded because it is the same as Item #40.
Item #15 Not Awarded due to Minimum Requirement by bidder.  Current Inventory prohibits acceptance
as item has not proved to be popular with students.

Whole grain Turkey Roast Bkft Stuffed Egg Patties,
Swch, Potatoes
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ITEM
ea Variety ea Lasagna

Quantity: 600 cs 400 cs 2,000 cs 500 cs
0516990 0517070 0517170 0514500

ITEM NUMBER 17 18 19 20
Asian Food Solutions
Oviedo, FL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Father's Table
Sanford, FL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
US Foods-Lakeland 0.1604 0.4123
Lakeland, FL No Bid 13.47 m 19.79 No Bid
American Foods Group
Oklahoma City, OK No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
American Pride Seafoods
New Bedford, MA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bake Crafters Food Co 0.3663
Collegedale, TN No Bid No Bid 17.58 No Bid
Cargill Kitchen Solutions 0.3174
Monticello, MN 39.99 a,u No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cargill Meat Solutions
Wichita, KS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Chef's Corner Foods
Hayward, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Don Lee Farms
Inglewood, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Filled Bagel Industries
Avon, IN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
ES Foods
Woodbury, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hadley Farms, Inc.
Smithsburg, MD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
J&J Snack Foods Co.
Pennsauken, NJ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Jennie-O Turkey Store
Willmar, MN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
JTM
Harrison, OH No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Kelley Foods 0.4171
Elba, AL 30.03 a,u No Bid No Bid No Bid
Lings
South El Monte, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pilgrim's
Tucker, GA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pro View Foods
Gainesville, GA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Ridgefield's Brand Co.
Montgomery Village, MD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Super Bakery
Cleveland, OH No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sysco Gulf Coast 0.3660
Geneva, AL 26.35 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tasty Brands 0.5480
Hicksville, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid 60.28

Mini Pancakes Bagels Muffin, Whole gr Cheese
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ITEM
Frozen Omelet ea

Quantity: 1,600 cs 900 cs 200 cs
0517090 0517021 0516080

ITEM NUMBER 21 22 23 24
Asian Food Solutions
Oviedo, FL No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A
Father's Table
Sanford, FL No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A
US Foods-Lakeland
Lakeland, FL No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A
American Foods Group
Oklahoma City, OK No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A
American Pride Seafoods
New Bedford, MA No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A
Bake Crafters Food Co
Collegedale, TN No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A
Cargill Kitchen Solutions 0.2688
Monticello, MN No Bid No Bid 60.47 N/A
Cargill Meat Solutions
Wichita, KS No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A
Chef's Corner Foods
Hayward, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A
Don Lee Farms
Inglewood, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A
Filled Bagel Industries
Avon, IN No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A
ES Foods
Woodbury, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A
Hadley Farms, Inc.
Smithsburg, MD No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A
J&J Snack Foods Co.
Pennsauken, NJ No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A
Jennie-O Turkey Store
Willmar, MN No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A
JTM
Harrison, OH No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A
Kelley Foods 0.4167
Elba, AL No Bid 30.00 a,u No Bid N/A
Lings
South El Monte, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A
Pilgrim's
Tucker, GA No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A
Pro View Foods
Gainesville, GA No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A
Ridgefield's Brand Co.
Montgomery Village, MD No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A
Super Bakery                    ^^ .24/.24/.29
Cleveland, OH No Bid No Bid N/A
Sysco Gulf Coast 0.4299
Geneva, AL No Bid 30.95 No Bid N/A
Tasty Brands
Hicksville, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A

^^ Vendor Bid 3 products - All three accepted.  District may order one or in combination.

Donuts, Waffle Colby Cheese NOT AN ITEM;
BEEF DESCRIP

19.20/19.20/23.20
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ITEM
Mini Burgers ea Fries lb Beef Patties ea

Quantity: 600 cs 150 lb 500 cs 900 cs
0515090 0516030 0516490 0516115

ITEM NUMBER 25 26 27 28
Asian Food Solutions
Oviedo, FL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Father's Table
Sanford, FL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
US Foods-Lakeland
Lakeland, FL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
American Foods Group 0.3581 0.5155
Oklahoma City, OK 71.62 No Bid No Bid 103.10
American Pride Seafoods
New Bedford, MA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bake Crafters Food Co
Collegedale, TN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cargill Kitchen Solutions
Monticello, MN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cargill Meat Solutions
Wichita, KS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Chef's Corner Foods
Hayward, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Don Lee Farms 0.1688 0.3885
Inglewood, CA 30.38 a,u No Bid No Bid 39.63 m,u
Filled Bagel Industries
Avon, IN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
ES Foods
Woodbury, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hadley Farms, Inc.
Smithsburg, MD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
J&J Snack Foods Co.
Pennsauken, NJ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Jennie-O Turkey Store
Willmar, MN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
JTM 0.1974 0.5767
Harrison, OH 82.30 m,u No Bid No Bid 112.45 m
Kelley Foods 0.5366
Elba, AL No Bid No Bid No Bid 62.25
Lings
South El Monte, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pilgrim's 1.5000
Tucker, GA No Bid No Bid 22.50 a,u No Bid
Pro View Foods 1.4500
Gainesville, GA No Bid No Bid 14.50 a,Y No Bid
Ridgefield's Brand Co.
Montgomery Village, MD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Super Bakery
Cleveland, OH No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sysco Gulf Coast 0.4889
Geneva, AL No Bid No Bid No Bid 44.00
Tasty Brands
Hicksville, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Not Awarded

Beef, Salami Chicken Ground 

Page 7



ITEM
(Broiler) Sausage lb Sausage, Link ea Steak Patty

Quantity: 400 cs 100 cs 300 cs 500 cs
0516116 0516120 0516130 0516131

ITEM NUMBER 29 30 31 32
Asian Food Solutions
Oviedo, FL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Father's Table
Sanford, FL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
US Foods-Lakeland
Lakeland, FL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
American Foods Group
Oklahoma City, OK No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
American Pride Seafoods
New Bedford, MA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bake Crafters Food Co
Collegedale, TN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cargill Kitchen Solutions
Monticello, MN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cargill Meat Solutions
Wichita, KS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Chef's Corner Foods
Hayward, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Don Lee Farms 0.2320 a,Y
Inglewood, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid 27.84 m,u
Filled Bagel Industries
Avon, IN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
ES Foods
Woodbury, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hadley Farms, Inc.
Smithsburg, MD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
J&J Snack Foods Co.
Pennsauken, NJ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Jennie-O Turkey Store
Willmar, MN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
JTM
Harrison, OH No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Kelley Foods 0.6070 2.4900 0.1613
Elba, AL 60.70 24.90 30.96 No Bid
Lings
South El Monte, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pilgrim's
Tucker, GA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pro View Foods
Gainesville, GA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Ridgefield's Brand Co.
Montgomery Village, MD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Super Bakery
Cleveland, OH No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sysco Gulf Coast 2.1100 0.3373
Geneva, AL No Bid 21.10 No Bid 23.95
Tasty Brands
Hicksville, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Not Awarded Not Awarded

Item #29 to be pulled from District Menu - broilers no longer used to cook burgers.
Item #31 to be pulled from District Menu - no longer using pork breakfast links, now serving turkey links.

Gr. Beef Patties Smoked Smoked Bkfst Beef
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ITEM
Bulk Fried Steak ea Italian

Quantity: 400 cs 1,000 cs 400 cs 600 cs
0516140 0516151 0516170 0516190

ITEM NUMBER 33 34 35 36
Asian Food Solutions
Oviedo, FL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Father's Table
Sanford, FL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
US Foods-Lakeland
Lakeland, FL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
American Foods Group 2.5190
Oklahoma City, OK No Bid No Bid No Bid 75.57
American Pride Seafoods
New Bedford, MA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bake Crafters Food Co
Collegedale, TN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cargill Kitchen Solutions
Monticello, MN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cargill Meat Solutions
Wichita, KS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Chef's Corner Foods
Hayward, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Don Lee Farms 0.4485 2.2000
Inglewood, CA No Bid 32.29 a,u No Bid 22.00 p,u
Filled Bagel Industries
Avon, IN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
ES Foods
Woodbury, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hadley Farms, Inc.
Smithsburg, MD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
J&J Snack Foods Co.
Pennsauken, NJ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Jennie-O Turkey Store
Willmar, MN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
JTM 0.5916 0.5428 2.7150
Harrison, OH No Bid 81.64 m 96.08 m 81.45 m
Kelley Foods
Elba, AL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Lings
South El Monte, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pilgrim's
Tucker, GA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pro View Foods
Gainesville, GA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Ridgefield's Brand Co.
Montgomery Village, MD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Super Bakery
Cleveland, OH No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sysco Gulf Coast 0.5994
Geneva, AL No Bid 50.95 No Bid No Bid
Tasty Brands
Hicksville, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Not Awarded

Gr. Beef, Country Taco Meat Beef Meatballs,
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ITEM
Canned Turkey Ham (Raw)

Quantity: 2,000 lb 75 cs 2,000 lb 6,000 lb
0516240 0504130 0516220 0516311

ITEM NUMBER 37 38 39 40
Asian Food Solutions
Oviedo, FL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Father's Table
Sanford, FL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
US Foods-Lakeland
Lakeland, FL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
American Foods Group
Oklahoma City, OK No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
American Pride Seafoods
New Bedford, MA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bake Crafters Food Co
Collegedale, TN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cargill Kitchen Solutions
Monticello, MN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid ,
Cargill Meat Solutions 2.2953 2.9853
Wichita, KS No Bid No Bid 68.86 a,u 56.72 Y
Chef's Corner Foods
Hayward, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Don Lee Farms
Inglewood, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Filled Bagel Industries
Avon, IN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
ES Foods
Woodbury, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hadley Farms, Inc.
Smithsburg, MD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
J&J Snack Foods Co.
Pennsauken, NJ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Jennie-O Turkey Store
Willmar, MN No Bid No Bid 1.90 m 2.29 m
JTM
Harrison, OH No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Kelley Foods
Elba, AL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Lings
South El Monte, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pilgrim's
Tucker, GA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pro View Foods
Gainesville, GA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Ridgefield's Brand Co.
Montgomery Village, MD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Super Bakery
Cleveland, OH No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sysco Gulf Coast 10.8333
Geneva, AL No Bid 65.00 1.90 2.39
Tasty Brands
Hicksville, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Not Awarded
Item 38 Not Awarded - Food Service now using frozen chicken instead of canned.
Item 39 - 43 Awarded as a Lot

Ham Chicken, Chunk Deli Style Turkey Roast

Page 10



ITEM
(Cooked) lb Ground lb Breast, Sliced lb Patty

Quantity: 6,000 cs 150 cs 400 cs 400 cs
0516312 0516321 0516340

ITEM NUMBER 41 42 43 44
Asian Food Solutions
Oviedo, FL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Father's Table
Sanford, FL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
US Foods-Lakeland
Lakeland, FL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
American Foods Group
Oklahoma City, OK No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
American Pride Seafoods
New Bedford, MA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bake Crafters Food Co
Collegedale, TN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cargill Kitchen Solutions
Monticello, MN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cargill Meat Solutions 3.1359 3.2170
Wichita, KS 89.06 a,Y No Bid 96.51 a,u No Bid
Chef's Corner Foods
Hayward, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Don Lee Farms 0.2968
Inglewood, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid 32.05 a,u
Filled Bagel Industries
Avon, IN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
ES Foods
Woodbury, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hadley Farms, Inc.
Smithsburg, MD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
J&J Snack Foods Co.
Pennsauken, NJ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Jennie-O Turkey Store
Willmar, MN 2.70 m 1.30 m 3.45 m No Bid
JTM 0.4101
Harrison, OH No Bid No Bid No Bid 68.90 m
Kelley Foods
Elba, AL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Lings
South El Monte, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pilgrim's
Tucker, GA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pro View Foods
Gainesville, GA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Ridgefield's Brand Co.
Montgomery Village, MD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Super Bakery
Cleveland, OH No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sysco Gulf Coast 2.7900 1.4200 3.5500
Geneva, AL 28.40 42.60 No Bid
Tasty Brands
Hicksville, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Turkey Roast Turkey, Roast Turkey Pork Rib
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ITEM
Sauce lb Nuggets lb Chicken Patty ea Frozen lb

Quantity: 100 cs 500 cs 1,600 cs 100 cs
0516520 0516562 0516572

ITEM NUMBER 45 46 47 48
Asian Food Solutions
Oviedo, FL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Father's Table
Sanford, FL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
US Foods-Lakeland
Lakeland, FL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
American Foods Group
Oklahoma City, OK No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
American Pride Seafoods
New Bedford, MA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bake Crafters Food Co
Collegedale, TN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cargill Kitchen Solutions
Monticello, MN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cargill Meat Solutions
Wichita, KS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Chef's Corner Foods
Hayward, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Don Lee Farms
Inglewood, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Filled Bagel Industries
Avon, IN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
ES Foods
Woodbury, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hadley Farms, Inc.
Smithsburg, MD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
J&J Snack Foods Co.
Pennsauken, NJ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Jennie-O Turkey Store
Willmar, MN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
JTM 1.5827
Harrison, OH 57.48 a,u No Bid No Bid No Bid
Kelley Foods 2.2090 0.6470 3.1330
Elba, AL No Bid 22.09 64.70 31.33
Lings
South El Monte, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pilgrim's 1.349/1.35 0.3543 2.5240
Tucker, GA No Bid 13.90/14.35 ^^ 21.26 75.72
Pro View Foods 1.3400 0.2969
Gainesville, GA No Bid 13.40 a, Y 19.00 No Bid
Ridgefield's Brand Co.
Montgomery Village, MD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Super Bakery
Cleveland, OH No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sysco Gulf Coast 2.0000 0.3655
Geneva, AL No Bid 21.20 36.55 No Bid
Tasty Brands
Hicksville, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
^^ Bid two products Not Awarded

Beef Spaghetti Chicken Grilled White Chicken, Diced
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ITEM
Buffalo lb Breast Rings

Quantity: 400 cs 300 cs 500 cs 500 cs
0516610 0516620

ITEM NUMBER 49 50 51 52
Asian Food Solutions
Oviedo, FL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Father's Table
Sanford, FL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
US Foods-Lakeland
Lakeland, FL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
American Foods Group
Oklahoma City, OK No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
American Pride Seafoods
New Bedford, MA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bake Crafters Food Co
Collegedale, TN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cargill Kitchen Solutions
Monticello, MN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cargill Meat Solutions
Wichita, KS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Chef's Corner Foods
Hayward, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Don Lee Farms
Inglewood, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Filled Bagel Industries
Avon, IN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
ES Foods
Woodbury, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hadley Farms, Inc.
Smithsburg, MD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
J&J Snack Foods Co.
Pennsauken, NJ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Jennie-O Turkey Store
Willmar, MN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
JTM
Harrison, OH No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Kelley Foods
Elba, AL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Lings
South El Monte, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pilgrim's 1.6823 3.6200 1.6476
Tucker, GA 50.47 36.20 a,Y 20.76 a,Y No Bid
Pro View Foods 2.3900 2.7000 1.4000 2.7000
Gainesville, GA 47.80 27.00 a,Y 14.00 a,Y 27.00 a,u
Ridgefield's Brand Co.
Montgomery Village, MD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Super Bakery
Cleveland, OH No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sysco Gulf Coast 1.5860 1.7445
Geneva, AL 39.65 17.45 No Bid No Bid
Tasty Brands
Hicksville, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Not Awarded

Chicken Tenders Spicy Breaded Breaded Chicken Breaded BBQ
Chicken Breast Chicken Chunks
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ITEM
Teriyaki Chick lb Hot Chicken lb Tenders

Quantity: 300 cs 500 cs 400 cs 300 cs
0516830 0516631 0516840

ITEM NUMBER 53 54 55 56
Asian Food Solutions 2.7248 3.6903
Oviedo, FL 114.44 No Bid 110.71 No Bid
Father's Table
Sanford, FL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
US Foods-Lakeland
Lakeland, FL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
American Foods Group
Oklahoma City, OK No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
American Pride Seafoods
New Bedford, MA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bake Crafters Food Co
Collegedale, TN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cargill Kitchen Solutions
Monticello, MN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cargill Meat Solutions
Wichita, KS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Chef's Corner Foods 2.6300 2.4600
Hayward, CA 92.05 a,Y No Bid 103.32 a,Y No Bid
Don Lee Farms
Inglewood, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Filled Bagel Industries
Avon, IN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
ES Foods
Woodbury, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hadley Farms, Inc.
Smithsburg, MD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
J&J Snack Foods Co.
Pennsauken, NJ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Jennie-O Turkey Store
Willmar, MN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
JTM
Harrison, OH No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Kelley Foods
Elba, AL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Lings 2.9850 4.5937
South El Monte, CA 125.37 m No Bid 137.81 No Bid
Pilgrim's
Tucker, GA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pro View Foods 2.6000
Gainesville, GA No Bid No Bid No Bid 52.00 a,Y
Ridgefield's Brand Co.
Montgomery Village, MD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Super Bakery
Cleveland, OH No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sysco Gulf Coast 2.9950
Geneva, AL No Bid No Bid No Bid 29.95
Tasty Brands
Hicksville, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Not Awarded

Smoked BBQ Chicken Wings, Mandarin Orange Chicken
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ITEM
Chicken Spicy Fajita lb Patty

Quantity: 100 cs 100 cs 100 cs 100 cs
0516870 0516880 0516890 0516900

ITEM NUMBER 57 58 59 60
Asian Food Solutions 3.0345
Oviedo, FL No Bid No Bid 121.38 a,Y No Bid
Father's Table
Sanford, FL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
US Foods-Lakeland
Lakeland, FL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
American Foods Group
Oklahoma City, OK No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
American Pride Seafoods
New Bedford, MA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bake Crafters Food Co
Collegedale, TN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cargill Kitchen Solutions
Monticello, MN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cargill Meat Solutions
Wichita, KS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Chef's Corner Foods
Hayward, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Don Lee Farms
Inglewood, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Filled Bagel Industries
Avon, IN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
ES Foods
Woodbury, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hadley Farms, Inc.
Smithsburg, MD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
J&J Snack Foods Co.
Pennsauken, NJ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Jennie-O Turkey Store
Willmar, MN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
JTM
Harrison, OH No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Kelley Foods
Elba, AL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Lings
South El Monte, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pilgrim's 1.8095 2.5240 0.3146
Tucker, GA 36.19 No Bid 75.72 49.07
Pro View Foods 1.3900 1.6200 2.7500 0.2545
Gainesville, GA 13.90 16.20 a,u 55.00 13.40 a,Y
Ridgefield's Brand Co.
Montgomery Village, MD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Super Bakery
Cleveland, OH No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sysco Gulf Coast
Geneva, AL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tasty Brands
Hicksville, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Not Awarded

Popcorn Popcorn Chicken Grilled Chicken Breaded Chicken
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ITEM
Patty, Spicy Shrimp Oven Style sv 3.6oz ea

Quantity: 100 cs 100 cs 1,200 cs 100 cs
0516910 0515020 0515070 0515032

ITEM NUMBER 61 62 63 64
Asian Food Solutions
Oviedo, FL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Father's Table
Sanford, FL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
US Foods-Lakeland 0.5547 0.6368
Lakeland, FL No Bid 29.40 25.47 No Bid
American Foods Group
Oklahoma City, OK No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
American Pride Seafoods 0.5925 0.4818
New Bedford, MA No Bid No Bid 23.70 a,u 21.20
Bake Crafters Food Co
Collegedale, TN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cargill Kitchen Solutions
Monticello, MN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cargill Meat Solutions
Wichita, KS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Chef's Corner Foods
Hayward, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Don Lee Farms
Inglewood, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Filled Bagel Industries
Avon, IN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
ES Foods
Woodbury, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hadley Farms, Inc.
Smithsburg, MD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
J&J Snack Foods Co.
Pennsauken, NJ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Jennie-O Turkey Store
Willmar, MN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
JTM
Harrison, OH No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Kelley Foods 0.6548 0.5273
Elba, AL No Bid No Bid 26.19 23.20
Lings
South El Monte, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pilgrim's 0.3197
Tucker, GA 49.87 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pro View Foods 0.2642
Gainesville, GA 14.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Ridgefield's Brand Co.
Montgomery Village, MD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Super Bakery
Cleveland, OH No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sysco Gulf Coast
Geneva, AL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tasty Brands
Hicksville, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Cod Portion,Breaded Chicken Frozen Popcorn Cod Nuggets,
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ITEM
Reduced Fat Beef Turkey ea

Quantity: 900 cs 800 cs 1,050 cs 1,050 cs
0515080 0516052 0516070 0516070

ITEM NUMBER 65 66 67 68
Asian Food Solutions
Oviedo, FL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Father's Table
Sanford, FL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
US Foods-Lakeland 0.3010
Lakeland, FL No Bid 21.67 No Bid No Bid
American Foods Group
Oklahoma City, OK No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
American Pride Seafoods 0.4950
New Bedford, MA 22.00 a,u No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bake Crafters Food Co
Collegedale, TN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cargill Kitchen Solutions
Monticello, MN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cargill Meat Solutions 0.1484
Wichita, KS No Bid No Bid No Bid 23.74 a,u
Chef's Corner Foods
Hayward, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Don Lee Farms
Inglewood, CA No Bid 10.80 No Bid No Bid
Filled Bagel Industries
Avon, IN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
ES Foods
Woodbury, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hadley Farms, Inc.
Smithsburg, MD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
J&J Snack Foods Co.
Pennsauken, NJ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Jennie-O Turkey Store 0.1050
Willmar, MN No Bid No Bid No Bid 16.80
JTM
Harrison, OH No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Kelley Foods 0.5455 0.3051
Elba, AL 24.00 a,u 21.97 No Bid No Bid
Lings
South El Monte, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pilgrim's
Tucker, GA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pro View Foods
Gainesville, GA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Ridgefield's Brand Co.
Montgomery Village, MD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Super Bakery
Cleveland, OH No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sysco Gulf Coast 0.3104 0.2906 0.1188
Geneva, AL No Bid 22.35 23.25 19.00
Tasty Brands
Hicksville, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Not Awarded
Item 65 to be pulled from District Menu.
Items 67 and 68 awarded as a lot.

Cod Portion, Corn Dog Frankfurters, Frankfurters,
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ITEM
Beef & Bean ea Burrito Stix ea

Quantity: 100 cs 300 cs 100 cs 1,200 cs
0516450 0517580 0516510

ITEM NUMBER 69 70 71 72
Asian Food Solutions
Oviedo, FL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Father's Table
Sanford, FL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
US Foods-Lakeland 0.6208 0.4023
Lakeland, FL No Bid 29.80 No Bid 25.75
American Foods Group
Oklahoma City, OK No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
American Pride Seafoods
New Bedford, MA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bake Crafters Food Co
Collegedale, TN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cargill Kitchen Solutions
Monticello, MN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cargill Meat Solutions
Wichita, KS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Chef's Corner Foods
Hayward, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Don Lee Farms
Inglewood, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Filled Bagel Industries
Avon, IN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
ES Foods
Woodbury, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hadley Farms, Inc.
Smithsburg, MD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
J&J Snack Foods Co.
Pennsauken, NJ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Jennie-O Turkey Store
Willmar, MN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
JTM
Harrison, OH No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Kelley Foods 0.6188 0.4067
Elba, AL No Bid 29.70 No Bid 26.03
Lings
South El Monte, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pilgrim's
Tucker, GA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pro View Foods
Gainesville, GA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Ridgefield's Brand Co.
Montgomery Village, MD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Super Bakery
Cleveland, OH No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sysco Gulf Coast
Geneva, AL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tasty Brands 0.4979 a
Hicksville, NY 53.77 Y No Bid No Bid No Bid

Not Awarded

Cheese Ravioli Burritos, Egg, Cheese Chili Fiesta

Page 18



ITEM
Sandwich Pocket Sndwch Sm, Grape Sandwich

Quantity: 100 cs 100 cs 100 cs 100 cs
0516801 0516810 0517450

ITEM NUMBER 73 74 75 76
Asian Food Solutions
Oviedo, FL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Father's Table
Sanford, FL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
US Foods-Lakeland
Lakeland, FL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
American Foods Group
Oklahoma City, OK No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
American Pride Seafoods
New Bedford, MA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bake Crafters Food Co
Collegedale, TN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cargill Kitchen Solutions
Monticello, MN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cargill Meat Solutions
Wichita, KS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Chef's Corner Foods
Hayward, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Don Lee Farms
Inglewood, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Filled Bagel Industries
Avon, IN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
ES Foods
Woodbury, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hadley Farms, Inc.
Smithsburg, MD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
J&J Snack Foods Co.
Pennsauken, NJ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Jennie-O Turkey Store
Willmar, MN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
JTM
Harrison, OH No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Kelley Foods 0.7683 0.7683
Elba, AL 18.44 18.44 No Bid No Bid
Lings
South El Monte, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pilgrim's
Tucker, GA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pro View Foods
Gainesville, GA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Ridgefield's Brand Co.
Montgomery Village, MD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Super Bakery
Cleveland, OH No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sysco Gulf Coast
Geneva, AL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tasty Brands
Hicksville, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Not Awarded Not Awarded

Pepperoni Pocket Ham & Cheese PB&J Crustless Stuffed
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ITEM
Lg, Grape Thaw

Quantity: 100 cs 100 cs 200 cs 120 cs
0517460 0517480 0516721

ITEM NUMBER 77 78 79 80
Asian Food Solutions
Oviedo, FL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Father's Table
Sanford, FL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
US Foods-Lakeland
Lakeland, FL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
American Foods Group
Oklahoma City, OK No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
American Pride Seafoods
New Bedford, MA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bake Crafters Food Co
Collegedale, TN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cargill Kitchen Solutions
Monticello, MN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cargill Meat Solutions
Wichita, KS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Chef's Corner Foods
Hayward, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Don Lee Farms
Inglewood, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Filled Bagel Industries
Avon, IN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
ES Foods 1.2000 0.8400
Woodbury, NY No Bid No Bid 36.00 40.32
Hadley Farms, Inc.
Smithsburg, MD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
J&J Snack Foods Co.
Pennsauken, NJ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Jennie-O Turkey Store
Willmar, MN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
JTM
Harrison, OH No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Kelley Foods
Elba, AL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Lings
South El Monte, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pilgrim's
Tucker, GA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pro View Foods
Gainesville, GA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Ridgefield's Brand Co.
Montgomery Village, MD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Super Bakery
Cleveland, OH No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sysco Gulf Coast
Geneva, AL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tasty Brands
Hicksville, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Not Awarded Not Awarded

PB&J Crustless PB&J Crustless Bkfst Meal w/ Milk Bkfst Meal
Sm, Strawberry
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ITEM
Thaw Breadstick ea Buns Bowls

Quantity: 250 cs 100 cs 500 cs 500 cs
0516642

ITEM NUMBER 81 82 83 84
Asian Food Solutions
Oviedo, FL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Father's Table
Sanford, FL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
US Foods-Lakeland
Lakeland, FL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
American Foods Group
Oklahoma City, OK No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
American Pride Seafoods
New Bedford, MA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bake Crafters Food Co 0.1159
Collegedale, TN No Bid 18.54 a,Y No Bid No Bid
Cargill Kitchen Solutions
Monticello, MN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cargill Meat Solutions
Wichita, KS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Chef's Corner Foods
Hayward, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Don Lee Farms
Inglewood, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Filled Bagel Industries 0.1163
Avon, IN No Bid 18.60 a,u No Bid No Bid
ES Foods 1.9000
Woodbury, NY 57.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hadley Farms, Inc.
Smithsburg, MD No Bid No Bid No Bid
J&J Snack Foods Co. 0.3333
Pennsauken, NJ No Bid No Bid 40.00 No Bid
Jennie-O Turkey Store
Willmar, MN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
JTM
Harrison, OH No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Kelley Foods
Elba, AL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Lings
South El Monte, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pilgrim's
Tucker, GA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pro View Foods
Gainesville, GA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Ridgefield's Brand Co.
Montgomery Village, MD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Super Bakery
Cleveland, OH No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sysco Gulf Coast
Geneva, AL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tasty Brands
Hicksville, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Not Awarded

Lunch Meal, Whole Wheat Pretzel Taco Shell
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ITEM
Flavored Eggs ea Juice Cup Ranch, Ind.

Quantity: 500 cs 1,000 pk 500 cs 100 cs
0517470 0507230

ITEM NUMBER 85 86 87 88
Asian Food Solutions
Oviedo, FL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Father's Table
Sanford, FL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
US Foods-Lakeland
Lakeland, FL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
American Foods Group
Oklahoma City, OK No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
American Pride Seafoods
New Bedford, MA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bake Crafters Food Co
Collegedale, TN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cargill Kitchen Solutions 0.1585
Monticello, MN No Bid 22.82 u No Bid No Bid
Cargill Meat Solutions
Wichita, KS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Chef's Corner Foods
Hayward, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Don Lee Farms
Inglewood, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Filled Bagel Industries
Avon, IN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
ES Foods
Woodbury, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hadley Farms, Inc.
Smithsburg, MD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
J&J Snack Foods Co. 0.2344
Pennsauken, NJ No Bid No Bid 22.50 No Bid
Jennie-O Turkey Store
Willmar, MN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
JTM
Harrison, OH No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Kelley Foods 0.1299
Elba, AL No Bid No Bid No Bid 12.99
Lings
South El Monte, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pilgrim's
Tucker, GA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pro View Foods
Gainesville, GA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Ridgefield's Brand Co. 0.2768
Montgomery Village, MD No Bid No Bid 23.25 No Bid
Super Bakery
Cleveland, OH No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sysco Gulf Coast 0.1594
Geneva, AL 22.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tasty Brands
Hicksville, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Not Awarded Not Awarded

Item 86 Not Awarded because shelf life of bid product would necessitate direct delivery, vendor bid
warehouse delivery instead of direct delivery.
Item 87 Not Awarded because student demand has decreased and inventory is not moving.

Tortilla, Hard Boiled Frozen Fruit

New Item for ECSD New Item for ECSD

Low-Fat
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ITEM
Gallon Catsup

Quantity: 100 cs 100 cs 100 cs 100 cs
0507050 0507090

ITEM NUMBER 89 90 91 92
Asian Food Solutions
Oviedo, FL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Father's Table
Sanford, FL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
US Foods-Lakeland
Lakeland, FL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
American Foods Group
Oklahoma City, OK No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
American Pride Seafoods
New Bedford, MA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bake Crafters Food Co
Collegedale, TN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cargill Kitchen Solutions
Monticello, MN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cargill Meat Solutions
Wichita, KS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Chef's Corner Foods
Hayward, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Don Lee Farms
Inglewood, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Filled Bagel Industries
Avon, IN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
ES Foods
Woodbury, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hadley Farms, Inc.
Smithsburg, MD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
J&J Snack Foods Co.
Pennsauken, NJ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Jennie-O Turkey Store
Willmar, MN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
JTM
Harrison, OH No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Kelley Foods 10.4650 20.2800 19.4850 12.4650
Elba, AL 20.93 40.56 38.97 24.93
Lings
South El Monte, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pilgrim's
Tucker, GA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pro View Foods
Gainesville, GA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Ridgefield's Brand Co.
Montgomery Village, MD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Super Bakery
Cleveland, OH No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sysco Gulf Coast
Geneva, AL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tasty Brands
Hicksville, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Mayonnaise Low-Fat Ranch TomatoMustard
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ITEM
Sndwch lb Lo Mein lb ea Crinkle Cut

Quantity: 500 cs 500 cs 400 cs 500 cs
0516460

ITEM NUMBER 93 94 95 96
Asian Food Solutions 1.9417 0.4250 a
Oviedo, FL No Bid 65.24 Y 40.80 Y No Bid
Father's Table
Sanford, FL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
US Foods-Lakeland
Lakeland, FL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
American Foods Group
Oklahoma City, OK No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
American Pride Seafoods
New Bedford, MA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bake Crafters Food Co
Collegedale, TN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cargill Kitchen Solutions
Monticello, MN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cargill Meat Solutions
Wichita, KS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Chef's Corner Foods 1.3860
Hayward, CA No Bid 41.58 Y No Bid No Bid
Don Lee Farms
Inglewood, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Filled Bagel Industries
Avon, IN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
ES Foods 0.6045 a,u
Woodbury, NY 58.03 m,u No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hadley Farms, Inc.
Smithsburg, MD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
J&J Snack Foods Co.
Pennsauken, NJ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Jennie-O Turkey Store
Willmar, MN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
JTM
Harrison, OH No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Kelley Foods
Elba, AL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Lings
South El Monte, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pilgrim's
Tucker, GA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pro View Foods
Gainesville, GA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Ridgefield's Brand Co.
Montgomery Village, MD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Super Bakery
Cleveland, OH No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sysco Gulf Coast
Geneva, AL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tasty Brands
Hicksville, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Not Awarded Not Awarded

94 - Awarded to both vendors,  products totally different, double award will  allow District the
opportunity to try both products.

New Item for ECSD

Toasted Cheese Vegetable Egg Roll Sweet Potato
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ITEM
Reg. Sticks w/Vegetables lb California Roll ea

Quantity: 500 cs 500 cs 500 cs
0516850

ITEM NUMBER 97 98 99
Asian Food Solutions
Oviedo, FL No Bid 88.00 u No Bid
Father's Table
Sanford, FL No Bid No Bid No Bid
US Foods-Lakeland
Lakeland, FL No Bid No Bid No Bid
American Foods Group
Oklahoma City, OK No Bid No Bid No Bid
American Pride Seafoods
New Bedford, MA No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bake Crafters Food Co
Collegedale, TN No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cargill Kitchen Solutions
Monticello, MN No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cargill Meat Solutions
Wichita, KS No Bid No Bid No Bid
Chef's Corner Foods
Hayward, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid
Don Lee Farms
Inglewood, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid
Filled Bagel Industries
Avon, IN No Bid No Bid No Bid
ES Foods
Woodbury, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hadley Farms, Inc.
Smithsburg, MD No Bid No Bid No Bid
J&J Snack Foods Co.
Pennsauken, NJ No Bid No Bid No Bid
Jennie-O Turkey Store
Willmar, MN No Bid No Bid No Bid
JTM
Harrison, OH No Bid No Bid No Bid
Kelley Foods
Elba, AL No Bid No Bid No Bid
Lings 2.1213
South El Monte, CA No Bid 29.68 No Bid
Pilgrim's
Tucker, GA No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pro View Foods
Gainesville, GA No Bid No Bid No Bid
Ridgefield's Brand Co.
Montgomery Village, MD No Bid No Bid No Bid
Super Bakery
Cleveland, OH No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sysco Gulf Coast
Geneva, AL No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tasty Brands
Hicksville, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid

Not Awarded Not Awarded

Item 98-Asian Food - bid not clear.

Sw. Potato Kung Pao Chick Sushi,
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a = Alternate Product Bid
m = Minimum Bid by Vendor
a,u = Alternate product bid.  Product not approved in taste test or no sample was sent by bidder.
Y = Product was approved in Taste Test
m = Bidder bid minimum ship quantities
m,u = Minimum ship quantity bid is not acceptable for that item
p,u = Vendor pack size not acceptable

BID TABULATION, RECOMMENDATIONS, AND PROTEST
Bid tabulations with award recommendations are posted for 72 hours in the Purchasing 
Department Office and are also posted to the School District's website address at: 
http://old.escambia.k12.fl.us/adminoff/finance/purchasing/current_bid_activity.html

Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in
Section 120.57(3) Florida Statutes, and School Board Rules shall constitute a waiver of proceedings.
Bid tabulations or recommendations will be distributed solely through the Purchasing 
website address.  Notices will not be automatically mailed.

I hereby certify that the prices and bidders reflected herein are valid, and have been received
in compliance to Escambia County School Board Rules and Florida Law.

John Dombroskie, Director
Purchasing Department
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